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OSC Turf – Plant Protection Control Products 

The Ontario Seed Company has been committed to offering quality brand name plant protection products for 

many years. With a continued demand on applicators' to be environmentally responsible, we believe that 

research and technical support are the keys to ensuring that the right products are applied for individual 

situations. Please browse our complete line of plant protection products and contact one of our sales 

representatives for further technical assistance. 
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Fungicides 

Banner Maxx Banner Maxx is the industry leader in dollar spot control. 2 x 3.78 L 

Banol 
Banol turf fungicide delivers preventive and curative systemic protection 
against Pythium species associated with Blight and Dampening-off, with very 
low potential for resistance. 

4 x 3.78 L 

Civitas & Harmonizer 

CIVITAS™ is a two part system intended to be used with Civitas Harmonizer. 
Civitas treats disease and works to prevent diseases from taking hold in the 
first place with no known resistance risk. A unique Mode of Action in Civitas is 
Induced Systemic Resistance (ISR). Civitas helps turf become healthier and 
therefore less prone to stress. In addition, Civitas provides a barrier that helps 
prevent pathogens from accepting or using the host plant. 

Civitas: 
20 L 

 
Harmonizer: 

1.25 L 

Compass 50 WDG 

Compass® fungicide is a broad-spectrum strobilurin fungicide that offers a 
revolutionary mesostemic mode of action delivering the highest efficacy at 
very low rates against turfgrass diseases, especially brown patch, 
anthracnose, leaf spot, and gray leaf spot. 

4 x 454 g 

Concert 
Concert fungicide provides golf course superintendents with preventive and 
curative disease control on all playing surfaces by using a proprietary blend of 
the active ingredients from Banner Maxx and Daconil. 

2 x 10 L 

Daconil Ultrex 

Daconil Ultrex is water dispersible granule formulation containing 82.5 % 
Chlorothalonil. Daconil Ultrex has a built-in surfactant, adjuvant and 
compatibility system called WeatherStik. The WeatherStik technology 
provides extended protection, even after heavy rains or irrigation. 

4 x 2.27 kg 
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Fungicides (continued) 

Daconil 2787 
DACONIL 2787 is a contact fungicide that targets multiple sites in the fungal 
pathogen. 

2 x 10 L 

Exteris Stressgard 
Exteris Stressgard is a new fungicide in the SDHI class of chemistry that is 
combined with trifloxystrobin to provide long-lasting, preventative and 
curative control of foliar turf diseases. 

2 x 10 L 

Heritage Maxx 

Heritage Maxx is the only systemic strobilurin translocated upward through 
the roots, crown, stems and leaves, protecting the entire plant. Heritage 
Maxx is effective against root-borne disease due to its ability to be taken up 
quickly by the roots and because of its systemic and curative properties. 

2 x 3.78 L 

Instrata 
Instrata fungicide is the foremost product for protection against both pink 
and grey snow mould. Its combination of 3 active ingredients is uniquely 
capable of outperforming conventional snow mould products and tank mixes. 

2 x 7.1 L 

Interface Stressgard 

Interface Stressgard provides flexible, effective disease control under all 
conditions. The combination of iprodione, trifloxystrobin and Stressgard 
Formulation Technology provides a solution for diseases and plant stresses 
under hot, cool, wet or dry conditions. 

2 x 10 L 

Kabuto 
Kabuto fungicide delivers a new and unique active ingredient for powerful 
Dollar Spot control. Kabuto makes an excellent alternative to DMI (Group 3) 
chemistry when trying to manage fungicide resistance. 

4 x 2 L 

Medallion 
Medallion is a broad-spectrum, contact fungicide that offers protection 
against several damaging diseases, including Fusarium patch, Anthracnose, 
Leaf Spot and Brown Patch. 

2 x 3.78 L 

Mirage Stressgard 

Mirage Stressgard provides broad-spectrum control of important diseases like 
dollar spot, anthracnose, summer patch, fairy ring and snow moulds on 
fairways, tees, and greens. Tebuconazole powered by Stressgard Formulation 
Technology provides a great solution for tough diseases, while minimizing 
negative turf growth regulator effects that are seen with other DMI 
fungicides. 

2 x 5 L 
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Fungicides (continued) 

Primo Maxx 
The original and trusted turf growth regulator that pre-conditions for stress 
and optimises surface quality and resources. 

2 x 3.78 L 

Renovo 

Renovo is a broad spectrum systemic fungicide that offers golf courses a 
unique mode of action. Renovo is the only FRAC Group 1 fungicide registered 
for control of turf diseases in Canada. This makes Renovo an effective tankmix 
or rotational product. 

2 x 10 L 

Signature Stressgard 

Signature Stressgard (formerly Aliette Signature) is a unique, highly systemic 
fungicide that represents an invaluable tool in preventing diseases related to 
stress like the Pythiums spp. With its complex mode of action, Signature 
Stressgard is also known to improve turf quality by enhancing the plants 
defense mechanisms and vigour. 

4 x 2.26 kg 

Subdue Maxx 
Subdue Maxx systemic fungicide provides outstanding Pythium control for all 
seasons. 

4 x 1 L 

Trilogy Stressgard 
Trilogy SC with Stressgard formulation technology combines winter long triple 
protection against snow moulds and improves turf quality. 

2 X 10 L 

Triton Stressgard 
Broad spectrum DMI that offers excellent control of Anthracnose, Dollar Spot, 
Brown Patch, as well as Pink and Gray Snow Mould. 

4 x 2 L 

Velista 
Velista fungicide is the only SDHI labeled for anthracnose in the golf market. 
Velista also protects against dollar spot, brown patch and more. Ideal for 
spring and fall clean up on greens, tees and fairways. 

6 x 624 g 
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Herbicides 

Dimension 
DIMENSION specialty herbicide provides pre-emergence and early post-
emergence control of crabgrass. 

4 x 4 L 

Gramoxone 
GRAMOXONE is a non-residual Herbicide for the control of many Grasses and 
Broadleaf Weeds. Inactivated on contact with the soil. 

4 x 5 L 

Mecoprop-P 
MECOPROP-P provides post emergent control of broadleaf weeds such as 
chickweed, clover and plantain. 

2 x 10 L 

Par III 
PAR III is a broad-spectrum herbicide specially formulated with 3 active 
ingredients to control hard-to-kill annual and perennial weeds in turfgrass. 

2 x 10 L 

QuickSilver 
QUICKSILVER works by effectively inhibiting a key enzyme in moss chlorophyll 
production. It leaves minimal residue following application allowing for fast 
reestablishment of bentgrass. 

4 x 237 mL 

Reward 
For control of weeds in still or slow-moving water and for weed control in 
non-crop land. 

4 x 3.78 L 

Roundup 
WeatherMAX 

ROUNDUP WEATHERMAX is a non-selective herbicide with the active 
ingredient glyphosate. 

2 x 10 L 

Vanquish 
VANQUISH controls deciduous and confierous brush species as well as 
broadleaf weeds. 

2 x 10 L 

Velocity 
VELOCITY is a postemergence herbicide that will selectively reduce the 
presence of annual bluegrass (Poa annua) within bentgrass, perennial 
ryegrass, Kentucky bluegrass and tall fescue. 

5 x 4 x 56.7 g 
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Insecticides 

Acelepryn 
ACELEPRYN insecticide is a suspension concentrate with unmatched season 
long control with a single application. Provides control of grub species, 
caterpillars (cutworm) and annual bluegrass weevils. 

4 x 1.89 L 

Arena 50 WDG 
Arena 50 WDG insecticide is a broad spectrum insecticide for control of a 
wide spectrum of insects infesting turfgrass and provides excellent and long 
residual insect control. 

4 x 1.13 Kg 

DeltaGard SC 
DELTAGARD is a highly effective, fast acting contact insecticide to control 
chinch bug, cutworm, ants, sodweb worm and ticks in turf. 

4 x 1 L 

Merit 0.5 G 
Granular 

MERIT has fast become the standard proven insecticide for grub control on a 
wide range of turf surfaces. Ready-to-use granular. 

13.6 kg 

Merit 75 WP 
Solupak 

MERIT has fast become the standard proven insecticide for grub control on a 
wide range of turf surfaces. Solupak formulation; 75% wettable powder in a 
soluble bag. 

16 x 45 g 

Pyrate 480 EC 

PYRATE 480 EC is a highly effective insecticide for the control of turf pests 
such as ants, chinch bugs, cutworm, leatherjackets, sod webworms and 
turfgrass weevils on golf courses, highway medians, industrial sites and sod 
farms. 

2 x 10 L 

Sevin T&O 
SEVIN T&O provides excellent control of surface feeding insects. It is an 
outstanding curative insect control material, has a short soil residual, and a 
favourable applicator and environmental record. 

2 x 10 L 
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Class 11 

Acecap 
Acecap systemic insecticide implants are used for control of certain 
destructive pests of ornamental and forest trees. Easy-to-use encapsulated 
implants. No mixing, measuring, or spraying required. 

100 x 77.3 g 

Fiesta 
Fiesta turf weed killer is a mineral-based herbicide that is perfect for spot 
treatment of broadleaf weeds in lawns, turf, parks, playgrounds, cemeteries 
and athletic fields. 

2 x 10 L 

Medicap MD 
12-4-4 

Medicap MD systemic nutrient implants for trees offer a special formulation 
of highly water soluble plant nutrients and are designed to stimulate tree 
foliage. Contains essential minor elements. This product may be helpful in 
promoting development of plant growth and is designed to be used in 
conjunction with soil applied fertilizers where possible. 

100 x 3/8" 

Munger 
Horticultural Vinegar 

Plus 

Munger Horticultural Vinegar Plus is a liquid herbicide for non-selective 
vegetation control in and around the garden, established trees and shrubs, 
sidewalks, driveways, and patio. It is specifically designed as a post emergent, 
foliar active, vegetation management product that is non-selective to green 
foliage and non residual in soil. 

2 x 10 L 

Phostrol 

Phostrol is an extremely systemic and highly unique phosphite fungicide that 
has both a direct and indirect effect on harmful turfgrass diseases. Phostrol is 
an effective, convenient and flexible tool for the management of Anthracnose 
and Pythium Blight. 

2 x 10 L 
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Specialty 

AntiFoam Agent 
AntiFoam Agent neutralizes foam in tank mixes to promote an even 
distribution of sprayable products. 

6 x 6 oz 

Blazon 

Blazon Spray Pattern Indicator is a non-staining blue liquid colorant designed 
to be used with pesticide, fertilizer and/or plant growth regulator tank mixes. 
Blazon provides visual assurance that these solutions are uniformly applied, 
with minimum overlap and no missed areas. 

2 x 10 L 

Big Foot WSB 
Big Foot WSB is a premium grade spray pattern indicator packaged in a 
convenient water soluble bag. Just drop the bag in the spray tank and that’s 
all! No measuring and no container disposal. 

Pail of 40 

Blue Lagoon 
Blue Lagoon pond dye adds a natural beauty to ponds, lakes, fountains and 
lagoons, coloring them a natural, beautiful blue. When used as directed, this 
product will not stain or harm fish or wildlife. 

2 x 2.5 Gal. 

Blue Lagoon WSB 

Blue Lagoon WSB pond dye adds a natural beauty to ponds, lakes, fountains 
and lagoons, coloring them a natural, beautiful blue and comes in a 
convenient easy-to-use water soluble bag configuration. When used as 
directed, this product will not stain or harm fish or wildlife. 

Pail of 50 

Fairway Snake 

Fairway snakes are designed to remove dew, clippings, and castings from 
fairways in a single pass, eliminating the catalyst of several turf diseases, 
without the use of chemicals. The heavy, durable cording is designed to last 
through multiple uses over several years. 

Available 
lengths: 
100 foot 
150 foot 
200 foot 

Gundown Max 
Foam Destroyer 

Gundown Max is formulated to aggressively neutralize foam in all pesticide 
and/or fertilizer tank mixes regardless of spray solution pH. Unlike ordinary 
defoamers, Gundown Max’s unique blend of formulation aids and emulsifiers 
will not precipitate in low pH spray solutions, making it ideal for use with all 
glyphosate formulations. 

12 x 946 mL 

Neutra Clean 
Neutra Clean spray tank cleaner is an extremely powerful cleaner/emulsifier. 
It re-emulsifies and suspends spray tank residues so that they may be 
removed from the interior of the spray equipment. 

4 x 1 Gal. 

Reel Diamond 
Lapping Compound 

Reel Diamond Lapping Compound is used to maintain consistent cutting 
performance of course mowers. 80 Grit and 100 Grit types are suitable for 
fairway mowers; 120 Grit is suitable for green and tee mowers. 

Available 
types: 
80 Grit 

100 Grit 
120 Grit 
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Specialty (continued) 

Wintergreen Scent 
Wintergreen Scent is a spray tank additive that contains a concentrated 
fragrance used to mask objectionable odours. 

12 x 946 mL 
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